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Item 1 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE PIPE
(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGTHS)
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME Charlotte Texas United Pipe  [Silverline, Charlotte Charlotte
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET N/A Net Sheet N/A
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. N/A 15 working days
DISC. OFF
Discount off Manufacturer Price List MFG. PRICE N/A Net Sheet
UNIT
1,000 feet PRICE 0.17 0.157 0.21 9.75
1. 1/2" schedule 40 PVC (Item No.14755) TOTAL 170.00 157.00 210.00 9,750.00
UNIT
1,500 feet PRICE 0.20 0.217 0.26 8.75
2. 3/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14776) TOTAL 300.00 325.50 390.00 13,125.00
UNIT
600 feet PRICE 0.32 0.313 0.35 10.50 8
3. 1" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14768) TOTAL 192.00 187.80 210.00 6,300.00 =0
UNIT 5 m
500 feet PRICE 0.41 0.408 0.46 12.25 =) E
4. 1-1/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14762) TOTAL 205.00 204.00 230.00 6,125.00 [aa T
UNIT L2
760 feet PRICE 0.48 0.49 0.56 13.90 - =
5. 1-1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14760) TOTAL 364.80 372.40 425.60 10,564.00 (ZD 8
UNIT
=z
1,300 feet PRICE 0.58 0.667 0.75 17.50 a=
6. 2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14770) TOTAL 754.00 867.10 975.00 22,750.00 o
UNIT
500 feet PRICE 1.02 1.093 1.18 25.00
7. 2-1/2" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 14771) TOTAL 510.00 546.50 590.00 12,500.00
UNIT
760 feet PRICE 1.19 1.30 1.53 31.00
8. 3" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 14775) TOTAL 904.40 988.00 1,162.80 23,560.00
UNIT
500 feet PRICE 1.73 1.856 2.08 41.00
9. 4" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 14782) TOTAL 865.00 928.00 1,040.00 20,500.00
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-9 TOTAL 4,265.20 4,576.30 5,233.40 125,174.00
Item 2 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME Spears Lasco Charlotte Charlotte
PRICE P-315-PF
Price Sheet SHEET Lasco List Pricing Select Item Net N/A
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EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. March 26, 2015 3/30/15 15 working days
DISC. OFF
Discount off Manufacturer Price List MFG. PRICE 75% 82.6/Net
SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTING (COLOR WHITE)
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.17 0.156 0.13 0.85
1. (Item No. 9148) TOTAL 17.00 15.60 13.00 85.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.14 0.124 0.11 0.80
2. (Item No. 9171) TOTAL 14.00 12.40 11.00 80.00
200 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.21 0.199 0.17 1.00
3. (Item No. 9152) TOTAL 42.00 39.80 34.00 200.00
200 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.14 0.138 0.12 0.85
4. (Item No. 9174) TOTAL 28.00 27.60 24.00 170.00
100 ea. UNIT 8
Adapter, size 1", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.24 0.228 0.19 1.25 E 2
5. (Item No. 9149) TOTAL 24.00 22.80 19.00 125.00 i $
150 ea. UNIT a E
Adapter, size 1", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.27 0.25 0.21 1.50 'f i
6. (Item No. 9168) TOTAL 40.50 37.50 31.50 225.00 =S
30 ea. UNIT % 8
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.39 0.353 0.30 1.50 nZ
7. (Item No. 9147) TOTAL 11.70 10.59 9.00 45.00 o
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.33 0.303 0.26 1.50
8. (Item No. 9170) TOTAL 9.90 9.09 7.80 45.00
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.44 0.405 0.34 1.75
9. (Item No. 9165) TOTAL 13.20 12.15 10.20 52.50
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.44 0.405 0.34 1.75
10. (Item No. 9169) TOTAL 22.00 20.25 17.00 87.50
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.59 0.544 0.46 2.00
11. (Item No. 9151) TOTAL 17.70 16.32 13.80 60.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.59 0.532 0.45 1.85
12. (Item No. 9173) TOTAL 29.50 26.60 22.50 92.50
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 2.01 1.851 1.57 6.50
13. (Item No. 9153) TOTAL 60.30 55.53 47.10 195.00
20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 2.50 2.298 1.95 7.40
14. (Item No. 9175) TOTAL 50.00 45.96 39.00 148.00
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50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3/4" x 1/2" end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.16 0.144 0.12 0.80
15. (Item No. 10092) TOTAL 8.00 7.20 6.00 40.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.29 0.264 0.22 1.00
16. (Item No. 10074) TOTAL 14.50 13.20 11.00 50.00
75 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.29 0.264 0.22 1.00
17. (Item No. 10094) TOTAL 21.75 19.80 16.50 75.00
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.39 0.353 0.43 1.50
18. (Item No. 9991) TOTAL 11.70 10.59 12.90 45.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.39 0.353 0.30 1.50
19. (Item No. 9990) TOTAL 19.50 17.65 15.00 75.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slipon  [PRICE 0.41 0.374 0.32 1.60
20. (Item No. 9988) TOTAL 20.50 18.70 16.00 80.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.67 0.618 0.76 2.00
21. (tem No. 10091) TOTAL 33.50 30.90 38.00 100.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.67 0.618 0.53 2.00 8
22. (Item No. 10090) TOTAL 33.50 30.90 26.50 100.00 E Q8
50 ea. UNIT 5 $
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.67 0.618 0.53 2.00 i
23. (Item No. 10106) TOTAL 33.50 30.90 26.50 100.00 9(3 ﬂ
50 ea. UNIT = a
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.67 0.618 0.53 2.00 5 g
24. (Item No. 10075) TOTAL 33.50 30.90 26.50 100.00 Z O
20 ea. UNIT o Z
Bushing, reducer, size 2 1/2" x 2" end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.09 0.995 1.22 3.00 m
25. (Item No. 10073) TOTAL 21.80 19.90 24.40 60.00
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.60 1.464 1.26 4.00
26. (Item No. 10076) TOTAL 32.00 29.28 25.20 80.00
75 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.24 0.228 0.28 1.00
27. (Item No. 10250) TOTAL 18.00 17.10 21.00 75.00
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.36 0.325 0.28 1.15
28. (Item No. 10249) TOTAL 10.80 9.75 8.40 34.50
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.39 0.353 0.30 1.20
29. (Item No. 10248) TOTAL 11.70 10.59 9.00 36.00
100 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.46 0.426 0.37 1.50
30. (Item No. 10244) TOTAL 46.00 42.60 37.00 150.00
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 1.61 1.483 1.26 3.80
31. (Item No. 10252) TOTAL 32.20 29.66 25.20 76.00
75 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.10 0.091 0.77 0.45
32. (Item No. 11100) TOTAL 7.50 6.83 57.75 33.75
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250 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.14 0.124 0.11 0.55
33. (Item No. 11120) TOTAL 35.00 31.00 27.50 137.50
200 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.24 0.220 0.19 0.75
34. (Item No. 11134) TOTAL 48.00 44.00 38.00 150.00
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.33 0.303 0.26 0.85
35. (Item No. 11099) TOTAL 33.00 30.30 26.00 85.00
50 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.36 0.325 0.28 0.90
36. (Item No. 11121) TOTAL 18.00 16.25 14.00 45.00
75 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.54 0.493 0.42 1.45
37. (Item No. 11102) TOTAL 40.50 36.98 31.50 108.75
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 1.87 1.714 1.47 4.50
38. (Item No. 11123) TOTAL 37.40 34.28 29.40 90.00
60 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression Size 3/4" PRICE 1.30 1.951 1.85 1.95
39. (Item No. 11114) TOTAL 78.00 117.06 111.00 117.00
60 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression Size 1" PRICE 1.50 2.534 2.88 2.90
40. (Item No. 11112) TOTAL 90.00 152.04 172.80 174.00 a
30 ea. UNIT L'I_J )
Coupling, compression, size 1 1/4" PRICE 2.19 3.884 3.80 4.25 < m
41. (Item No. 11117) TOTAL 65.70 116.52 114.00 127.50 5' w
30 ea. UNIT m E
Coupling, compression, size 1 1/2" PRICE 2.17 4.013 4.76 5.25 'i: E‘
42. (Item No. 11110) TOTAL 65.10 120.39 142.80 157.50 - S
80 ea. UNIT [oN®)
Coupling, compression, size 2" PRICE 291 5.216 6.51 6.50 z (2)
43. (Item No. 11113) TOTAL 232.80 417.28 520.80 520.00 Q=
50 ea. UNIT @
Coupling, compression, size 3" PRICE 8.53 12.843 19.96 17.50
44. (Item No. 11115) TOTAL 426.50 642.15 998.00 875.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.24 0.228 0.20 0.95
45. (Item No. 11701) TOTAL 7.20 6.84 6.00 28.50
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.11 0.138 0.12 0.80
46. (Item No. 11719) TOTAL 11.00 13.80 12.00 80.00
75 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.31 0.353 0.30 1.20
47. (Item No. 11707) TOTAL 23.25 26.48 22.50 90.00
200 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.14 0.156 0.13 0.75
48. (Item No. 11728) TOTAL 28.00 31.20 26.00 150.00
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.36 0.426 0.36 1.30
49. (Item No. 11702) TOTAL 18.00 21.30 18.00 65.00
150 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.20 0.277 0.24 1.00
50. (Item No. 11693) TOTAL 30.00 41.55 36.00 150.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.51 0.594 0.51 1.70
51. (Item No. 11703) TOTAL 15.30 17.82 15.30 51.00
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50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.42 0.491 0.42 1.45
52. (Item No. 11725) TOTAL 21.00 24.55 21.00 72.50
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.65 0.745 0.63 1.95
53. (Item No. 11700) TOTAL 19.50 22.35 18.90 58.50
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.45 0.530 0.45 1.50
54. (Item No. 11724) TOTAL 22.50 26.50 22.50 75.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.84 0.972 0.83 2.50
55. (Item No. 11706) TOTAL 25.20 29.16 24.90 75.00
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.72 0.828 0.71 2.30
56. (Item No. 11727) TOTAL 36.00 41.40 35.50 115.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 3.40 3.925 3.33 10.75
57. (Item No. 11718) TOTAL 102.00 117.75 99.90 322.50
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.61 3.020 2.57 8.50
58. (Item No. 11729) TOTAL 52.20 60.40 51.40 170.00
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.26 0.303 0.26 1.50
59. (Item No. 14899) TOTAL 13.00 15.15 13.00 75.00 a
50 ea. UNIT L'I_J )
Plug, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.31 0.353 0.30 1.50 < m
60. (Item No. 14907) TOTAL 15.50 17.65 15.00 75.00 5‘ L
250 ea. UNIT m E
Plug, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.37 0.426 0.36 1.60 'i: E‘
61. (Item No. 14898) TOTAL 92.50 106.50 90.00 400.00 - S
30 ea. UNIT [oN®)
Plug, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.50 0.568 0.59 1.55 z (2)
62. (Item No. 14903) TOTAL 15.00 17.04 17.70 46.50 9 -
50 ea. UNIT @
Plug, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.64 0.724 0.62 3.50
63. (Item No. 14902) TOTAL 32.00 36.20 31.00 175.00
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.78 0.895 0.76 4.50
64. (Item No. 14904) TOTAL 39.00 44.75 38.00 225.00
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3" end type slip on PRICE 177 2.026 2.55 5.50
65. (Item No. 14947) TOTAL 35.40 40.52 51.00 110.00
50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1/2" end type slip on PRICE 0.15 0.173 0.15 1.00
66. (Item No. 16544) TOTAL 7.50 8.65 7.50 50.00
150 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.17 0.199 0.16 1.00
67. (Item No. 16577) TOTAL 25.50 29.85 24.00 150.00
100 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.32 0.370 0.31 1.75
68. (Item No. 16536) TOTAL 32.00 37.00 31.00 175.00
30 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.50 0.576 0.49 2.00
69. (Item No. 16532) TOTAL 15.00 17.28 14.70 60.00
50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.60 0.702 0.60 2.50
70. (Item No. 16530) TOTAL 30.00 35.10 30.00 125.00
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50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.89 1.023 0.87 5.00
71. (Item No. 16566) TOTAL 44.50 51.15 43.50 250.00
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 3.84 4.433 3.77 12.20
72. (Item No. 16573) TOTAL 76.80 88.66 75.40 244.00
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 TOTAL 2,844.60 3,5613.48 3,819.25 9,171.50
Iltem 3 SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE PIPE (SUPPLIED IN 20*
LENGTHS)
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME Charlotte No Bid Charlotte
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET Nets N/A
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 15 working days
DISC. OFF ]
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE L,'_J a
1,000 ft. UNIT 5 m
1/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.24 No Bid 0.40 9.90 ) E
1. (Item No. 14756) TOTAL 240.00 400.00 9,900.00 9(3 5
500 ft. UNIT - a
3/4" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.34 No Bid 0.54 12.95 ==
2. (Item No. 14777) TOTAL 170.00 270.00 6,475.00 28
1,500 ft. UNIT nZ
1" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.48 No Bid 0.78 19.50 o
3. (Item No. 14769) TOTAL 720.00 1,170.00 29,250.00
500 ft. UNIT
1 1/4" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.67 No Bid 1.10 28.50
4. (Item No. 14763) TOTAL 335.00 550.00 14,250.00
500 ft. UNIT
11/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.74 No Bid 121 30.50
5. (Item No. 14761) TOTAL 370.00 605.00 15,250.00
1,500 ft. UNIT
2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 1.06 No Bid 1.71 40.00
6. (Item No. 14774) TOTAL 1,590.00 2,565.00 60,000.00
500 ft. UNIT
2 1/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 1.75 No Bid 2.79 63.00
7. (Item No. 14772) TOTAL 875.00 1,395.00 31,500.00
500 ft. UNIT
3" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 2.16 No Bid 341 76.00
8. (Item No. 14778) TOTAL 1,080.00 1,705.00 38,000.00
500 ft. UNIT
4" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 3.10 No Bid 4.92 105.75
9. (Item No. 14783) TOTAL 1,550.00 2,460.00 52,875.00
200 ft. UNIT
6" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 5.98 No Bid 9.43 210.25
10. (Item No. 14786) TOTAL 1,196.00 1,886.00 42,050.00
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200 ft. UNIT
8" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 8.99 No Bid 14.23 369.25
11. (Item No. 14794) TOTAL 1,798.00 2,846.00 73,850.00
*
No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM NO. 3 TOTAL 9,924.00 15,852.00 373,400.00
Item 4 SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME Spears Lasco Charlotte Charlotte
PRICE PVC 80-315
Price Sheet SHEET Lasco List Pricing Nets N/A
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. March 26, 2015 March 30, 2015 | 15 working days
DISC. OFF
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE 75% 81%
75 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 1.05 1.273 112 3.00
1. (SAWS No. 9156) TOTAL 78.98 95.48 84.00 225.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 131 1.589 1.40 3.60 o
2. (SAWS No. 9178) TOTAL 131.40 158.90 140.00 360.00 L,'_J a
100 ea. UNIT 5 M
Adapter, size 3/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 1.55 1.891 1.66 4.00 =) E
3. (SAWS No. 9159) TOTAL 155.00 189.10 166.00 400.00 g w
100 ea. UNIT o
Adapter, size 3/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 1.43 1.752 1.55 3.85 5 g
4. (SAWS No. 9182) TOTAL 143.00 175.20 155.00 385.00 Z 0O
50 ea. UNIT nZ
Adapter, size 1", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 2.28 2.786 2.45 5.50 o
5. (SAWS No. 9145) TOTAL 114.00 139.30 122.50 275.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 2.49 3.032 2.68 6.00
6. (SAWS No. 9179) TOTAL 249.00 303.20 268.00 600.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 3.70 4.514 3.97 8.30
7. (SAWS No. 9155) TOTAL 185.00 225.70 198.50 415.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 291 3.545 3.12 6.75
8. (SAWS No. 9177) TOTAL 145.50 177.25 156.00 337.50
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 453 5.535 4.87 10.50
9. (SAWS No. 9154) TOTAL 135.90 166.05 146.10 315.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 4.18 5.093 4.48 10.25
10. (SAWS No. 9176) TOTAL 209.00 254.65 224.00 512.50
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 7.92 9.655 8.50 17.75
11. (SAWS No. 9158) TOTAL 396.00 482.75 425.00 887.50
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 6.05 7.366 6.52 14.00
12. (SAWS No. 9181) TOTAL 605.00 736.60 652.00 1,400.00
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20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 14.07 17.161 13.41 30.00
13. (SAWS No. 9160) TOTAL 281.40 343.22 268.20 600.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 7.62 9.293 8.18 17.00
14. (SAWS No. 9183) TOTAL 381.00 464.65 409.00 850.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3/4" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.36 0.443 0.36 1.50
15. (SAWS No. 10087) TOTAL 18.00 22.15 18.00 75.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.03 1.255 1.10 3.00
16. (SAWS No. 10081) TOTAL 51.50 62.75 55.00 150.00
15ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type NP threads PRICE 2.16 1.255 2.32 3.00
17. (SAWS No. 10143) TOTAL 32.40 18.83 34.80 45.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.03 1.255 1.10 3.00
18. (SAWS No. 10082) TOTAL 51.50 62.75 55.00 150.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.61 1.967 1.73 4.25
19. (SAWS No. 10080) TOTAL 80.50 98.35 86.50 212.50
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 2.19 2.680 2.36 5.50 8
20. (SAWS No. 10079) TOTAL 43.80 53.60 47.20 110.00 E 2
30 ea. UNIT i $
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 2.19 2.680 2.36 5.50 g [
21. (SAWS No. 10078) TOTAL 65.70 80.40 70.80 165.00 < ﬂ
20 ea. UNIT =a
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slipon  [PRICE 2.19 2.680 2.36 5.50 5 g
22. (SAWS No. 10077) TOTAL 43.80 53.60 47.20 110.00 Z 0
10 ea. UNIT nZ
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.14 3.820 3.36 7.25 o
23. (SAWS No. 10084) TOTAL 31.40 38.20 33.60 72.50
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.14 3.820 3.36 7.25
24. (SAWS No. 10086) TOTAL 94.20 114.60 100.80 217.50
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.14 3.820 3.36 7.25
25. (SAWS No. 10085) TOTAL 94.20 114.60 100.80 217.50
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.14 3.820 3.36 7.25
26. (SAWS No. 10097) TOTAL 62.80 76.40 67.20 145.00
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.14 3.820 3.36 7.25
27. (SAWS No. 10083) TOTAL 94.20 114.60 100.80 217.50
15e€a. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2 1/2" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 5.44 6.634 5.84 12.00
28. (SAWS No. 10093) TOTAL 81.60 99.51 87.60 180.00
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 8.62 10.525 9.26 19.00
29. (SAWS No. 10111) TOTAL 86.20 105.25 92.60 190.00
15e€a. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 8.62 10.525 9.26 19.00
30. (SAWS No. 10088) TOTAL 129.30 157.88 138.90 285.00
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10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 4" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 11.95 14.573 12.82 26.00
31. (SAWS No. 10112) TOTAL 119.50 145.73 128.20 260.00
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 4" x 3", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 11.95 14.573 1.17 26.00
32. (SAWS No. 10089) TOTAL 119.50 145.73 11.70 260.00
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 1.09 1.331 1.23 4.00
33. (SAWS No. 10256) TOTAL 21.80 26.62 24.60 80.00
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.15 1.402 2.19 425
34. (SAWS No. 10260) TOTAL 34.50 42.06 65.70 127.50
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 2.05 2.491 2.19 6.00
35. (SAWS No. 10257) TOTAL 61.50 74.73 65.70 180.00
10 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 2.47 3.005 2.64 6.95
36. (SAWS No. 10255) TOTAL 24.70 30.05 26.40 69.50
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.47 3.005 2.64 6.95
37. (SAWS No. 10254) TOTAL 49.40 60.10 52.80 139.00
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 4.86 5.934 5.22 11.95 ]
38. (SAWS No. 10259) TOTAL 97.20 118.68 104.40 239.00 ",'_J a
40 ea. UNIT 5 [
Cap, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 11.63 14.177 12.48 26.00 =) E
39. (SAWS No. 10261) TOTAL 465.20 567.08 499.20 1,040.00 9(3 ﬂ
10 ea. UNIT o
Cap, size 4", end type slip on PRICE 19.60 23.907 21.04 41.75 5 g
40. (SAWS No. 10262) TOTAL 196.00 239.07 210.40 417.50 z 0O
100 ea. UNIT a z
Coupling, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 111 1.359 1.20 3.20 m
41. (SAWS No. 11126) TOTAL 111.00 135.90 120.00 320.00
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 111 1.839 1.63 4.00
42. (SAWS No. 11130) TOTAL 111.00 183.90 163.00 400.00
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 1.55 1.891 1.67 4.00
43. (SAWS No. 11127) TOTAL 155.00 189.10 167.00 400.00
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 2.36 2.880 2.53 5.75
44. (SAWS No. 11125) TOTAL 70.80 86.40 75.90 172.50
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.55 3.105 2.73 6.25
45. (SAWS No. 11133) TOTAL 76.50 93.15 81.90 187.50
75 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 2.74 3.334 2.95 6.75
46. (SAWS No. 11129) TOTAL 205.50 250.05 221.25 506.25
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 7.73 9.423 8.29 17.50
47. (SAWS No. 11131) TOTAL 154.60 188.46 165.80 350.00
200 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.77 2.168 1.91 4.25
48. (SAWS No. 10948) TOTAL 354.00 433.60 382.00 850.00
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30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 1.16 1.414 1.24 3.25
49. (SAWS No. 11711) TOTAL 34.80 42.42 37.20 97.50
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.61 0.752 0.67 2.00
50. (SAWS No. 11732) TOTAL 61.00 75.20 67.00 200.00
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 177 2.161 1.90 4.50
51. (SAWS No. 11715) TOTAL 35.40 43.22 38.00 90.00
75ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.78 0.959 0.85 2.50
52. (SAWS No. 11736) TOTAL 58.50 71.93 63.75 187.50
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 2.66 3.240 2.85 6.50
53. (SAWS No. 11712) TOTAL 79.80 97.20 85.50 195.00
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 1.27 1.545 1.37 3.50
54. (SAWS No. 11733) TOTAL 127.00 154.50 137.00 350.00
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 3.39 4.126 3.63 8.00
55. (SAWS No. 11710) TOTAL 67.80 82.52 72.60 160.00 A
40 ea. UNIT W~
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 1.69 2.070 1.82 4.50 :: o
56. (SAWS No. 11731) TOTAL 67.60 82.80 72.80 180.00 5‘ w
20 ea. UNIT oD
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 4.00 4.877 4.29 9.00 'f i
57. (SAWS No. 11709) TOTAL 80.00 97.54 85.80 180.00 - =
50 ea. UNIT % 8
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 1.82 2.218 1.96 4.50 nZ
58. (SAWS No. 11730) TOTAL 91.00 110.90 98.00 225.00 o
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 5.18 6.325 5.57 12.00
59. (SAWS No. 11714) TOTAL 103.60 126.50 111.40 240.00
60 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.19 2.680 2.37 6.00
60. (SAWS No. 11735) TOTAL 131.40 160.80 142.20 360.00
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 13.25 16.161 14.22 28.00
61. (SAWS No. 11716) TOTAL 265.00 323.22 284.40 560.00
10 ea. UNIT
Elobw, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 5.78 7.048 6.20 14.00
62. (SAWS No. 11737) TOTAL 57.80 70.48 62.00 140.00
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1/2" end type slip on PRICE 1.02 1.243 1.32 No Bid
63. (SAWS No. 14950) TOTAL 51.00 62.15 66.00
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.14 1.384 1.45 No Bid
64. (SAWS No. 14909) TOTAL 57.00 69.20 72.50
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 1.28 1.561 1.63 4.50
65. (SAWS No. 14951) TOTAL 25.60 31.22 32.60 90.00
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10 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.64 1.993 2.09 No Bid
66. (SAWS No. 14949) TOTAL 16.40 19.93 20.90
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 1.80 2.186 2.29 7.00
67. (SAWS No. 14948) TOTAL 36.00 43.72 45.80 140.00
30 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 2.37 2.893 3.03 7.25
68. (SAWS No. 14905) TOTAL 71.10 86.79 90.90 217.50
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 10.67 16.042 7.09 13.00
69. (SAWS No. 14952) TOTAL 213.40 320.84 141.80 260.00
10 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3", end type threaded PRICE 12.86 19.345 10.23 15.00
70. (SAWS No. 14906) TOTAL 128.60 193.45 102.30 150.00
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 1.74 2.118 1.86 5.00
71. (SAWS No. ) TOTAL 17.40 21.18 18.60 50.00
30 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.82 2.220 1.95 525
72. (SAWS No. 16578) TOTAL 54.60 66.60 58.50 157.50 a
50 ea. UNIT W~
Tee, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 2.27 2.777 2.44 6.25 :: o
73. (SAWS No. 16537) TOTAL 113.50 138.85 122.00 312.50 5‘ w
10 ea. UNIT oD
Tee, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 6.26 7.630 6.71 15.00 'f i
74. (SAWS No. 16533) TOTAL 62.60 76.30 67.10 150.00 - =
10 ea. UNIT % 8
Tee, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 6.26 7.630 6.71 15.00 nZ
75. (SAWS No. 16531) TOTAL 62.60 76.30 67.10 150.00 o
50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 7.82 9.539 8.34 18.00
76. (SAWS No. 16567) TOTAL 391.00 476.95 417.00 900.00
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 10.63 12.964 11.41 24.50
77. (SAWS No. 16574) TOTAL 106.30 129.64 114.10 245.00
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, reducer, size 2" x 2" x 1" PRICE 5.30 6.455 5.68 13.25
78. (SAWS No. 16653) TOTAL 106.00 129.10 113.60 265.00
30 ea. UNIT
Union, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.28 2.786 2.46 4.25
79. (SAWS No. 16965) TOTAL 68.40 83.58 73.80 127.50
20 ea. UNIT
Union, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 291 3.541 311 5.00
80, (SAWS No. 16990) TOTAL 58.20 70.82 62.20 100.00
40 ea. UNIT
Union, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 3.31 4.039 3.55 6.00
81. (SAWS No. 16959) TOTAL 132.40 161.56 142.00 240.00
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 6.58 8.025 7.06 10.75
82. (SAWS No. 16954) TOTAL 98.70 120.38 105.90 161.25
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15ea. UNIT
Union, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 7.45 9.089 7.99 11.75
83. (SAWS No. 16953) TOTAL 111.75 136.34 119.85 176.25
30 ea. UNIT
Union, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 10.10 12.320 10.84 16.00
84. (SAWS No. 16981) TOTAL 303.00 369.60 325.20 480.00
20 ea. UNIT
Union, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 18.81 22.941 20.18 27.25
85. (SAWS No. 16985) TOTAL 376.20 458.82 403.60 545.00
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NO. 4 TOTAL 10,621.43 13,078.45 11,258.05 24,186.25
Item 5 PVC DRAIN, WASTE AND VENT (DWV) FITTINGS, NON-
PRESSURE APPLICATIONS
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME Spears No Bid Nets Charlotte
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET N/A
o
EFF. DATE E o
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 15 working days i m
> E
DISC. OFF g u
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE =a
500 ea. UNIT '5 g
Plug 6" PVC DWV end type threaded PRICE 10.51 No Bid 6.15 14.00 Z 0
1. (SAWS No. 14913) TOTAL 5,255.00 3,075.00 7,000.00 &) Z
50 ea. UNIT M
Plug 4" PVC Sch DWV end type threaded PRICE 2.23 No Bid 191 6.00
2. (SAWS No. 14912) TOTAL 111.50 95.50 300.00
500 ea. UNIT
Adaptor Female 6" DR35 SW SWR end type Slip x Threaded PRICE 20.06 No Bid 12.71 27.50
3. (SAWS No. 9072) TOTAL 10,030.00 6,355.00 13,750.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adaptor Female 4" DR35 SW SWR end type Slip x Threaded PRICE 4.69 No Bid 271 6.00
4. (SAWS No. 9164) TOTAL 234.50 135.50 300.00
*
No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM NO. 5 TOTAL 15,631.00 9,661.00 21,350.00
Item 6 PVC CEMENT GLUE, HEAVY DUTY
100 Ea Pint UNIT
PVC cement, used for 1/2" to 12" Pvc Pipe , PRICE 8.51 9.752 7.99 13.50
1. Gray in Color (Item No. 12990) TOTAL 851.00 975.20 799.00 1,350.00
200 Ea. Quart UNIT
PVC Cement, Blue in color PRICE 13.79 12.795 10.68 13.00
2. (Item No. 10311) TOTAL 2,758.00 2,559.00 2,136.00 2,600.00
250 Ea. Pint UNIT
PVC Cement , Blue in Color PRICE 5.40 7.636 5.83 8.00
3. (Item No. 12992) TOTAL 1,350.00 1,909.00 1,457.50 2,000.00
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*
4. TOTAL FOR ITEM NO. 6 TOTAL 4,959.00 5,443.20 4,392.50 5,950.00
Iltem 7 PVC PRIMER
100 Quart UNIT
Type Surface Cleaner, Purple in Color PRICE 11.25 5.909 573 10.00
1. (Item No. 15022) TOTAL 1,125.00 590.90 573.00 1,000.00
300 Pint UNIT a
Type PVC Cleaner PRICE 6.75 4.136 5.35 12.00 W~
2. (Item No. 10492) TOTAL 2,025.00 1,240.80 1,605.00 3,600.00 :: o
* .| LIJ
2~
0w
TOTAL FOR ITEM NO. 7 TOTAL 3,150.00 1,831.70 2,178.00 4,600.00 S i
= =
[oN®)
Zz 0O
EXTENSION 1 nZ
)
EXTENSION 2
EXTENSION 3
EXTENSION 4
Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 10 days 3-5 days Stk 3 days 15 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BIDS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Altex Supply Longhorn, Inc. Demandstar
Ameri Pipe Moore Supply SAWS Website
Corix Water Products Morrison Supply
Ferguson National Wholesale Supply
Fortiline RCO Construction
HD Supply Techline Pipe
Hughes Supply Texas Irrigation Supply
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